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I am a researcher. I have investigated mortality in people 
with multiple sclerosis (MS),1 carefully considered the nu-
ances of different definitions of advanced human immu-
nodeficiency virus (HIV),2 and examined why people with 
HIV in slum settings drop out of care.3 While I conducted 
my research, I did not try to put myself in the shoes of 
someone living with MS facing an early death from the 
disease, think about how it would feel to have advanced 
HIV whether it was defined one way versus another, or 
imagine being too afraid to go to a clinic for fear of see-
ing somebody I know who might discover my HIV status. 
Admittedly, I did not think about the lives of the human 
beings I was researching; however, there were people's sto-
ries that struck me. There was the time I was poring over 
patients' files in an MS clinic to extract data, and I came 
across a woman whose first realization that something 
was wrong was when her legs gave out from under her 
when she was dancing with friends. She was in her 20s. 
I read her case report more than 15 years ago, and I will 
not forget it. Another time, research notes revealed that 
a woman in Kenya was unable to adhere to her antiret-
roviral therapy because thieves broke into her home and 
stole her belongings, including her medication. These sto-
ries brought the people I was researching to life, but never 
more so than when I became a patient myself.

Six years ago, when I was nearing the end of my doc-
toral studies, I had a grand mal seizure and woke up in 
an ambulance en route to the hospital, where my brain 

cancer diagnosis awaited. A few months later, a craniot-
omy left me with not only a partially resected tumor, but 
drug-resistant epilepsy (DRE) as well. The words “drug-
resistant epilepsy” do nothing to conjure up the horror of 
living with a disease in which you are constantly under 
threat of attack. With less than seconds of notice, I go from 
being a seemingly normal, healthy person to one who is 
drooling, whose face contorts and convulses, and who 
loudly moans and groans uncontrollably. When the surge 
of electricity finally releases me, I am left exhausted and 
literally speechless, as my seizures originate in Broca's area 
of my brain. Epilepsy affects my well-being far beyond my 
1–2-min seizures. Prodromes last days, with symptoms in-
cluding nervousness, nightmares, migraines, exhaustion, 
and a host of other signs that mimic serious mental health 
disorders, such as obsessive and intrusive thoughts. Then 
there is postseizure recovery, which entails at least 3 days 
of painful headaches and extreme fatigue.

When DRE landed me on permanent disability, I started 
to research ways to reduce my seizure frequency. I came 
across the ketogenic diet,4 which helped somewhat. Then 
I started a high-intensity exercise program (CrossFit), and 
completely unexpectedly, it reduced the number of my sei-
zures by 33% over a 6-month period. Having two or three 
seizures per month compared to four made a profound 
difference in my life. A reduction in seizures means fewer 
preseizure migraines and frightening prodromal symp-
toms, less time spent in bed recovering from a seizure, and 
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a reduced risk of having a seizure in public. This allowed 
me to participate more fully in social activities and rela-
tionships. Fewer days in bed meant more time with my 
children, less chance of canceling plans to meet a friend, 
and reduced anxiety of being “hemmed in” at a restaurant 
or other public place where I might not be able to escape 
to endure my seizure in private. The problems I was hav-
ing with suicide and death ideation started to disappear, 
and I became a much happier person. I wrote a case report 
on my experience,5 during which I discovered that a 50% 
reduction in seizure frequency is commonly considered 
“clinically significant.”6

The endpoint of a 50% reduction in seizure frequency 
originated from the US Food and Drug Administration 
and European Medicines Agency requirement of a stan-
dardized target for pharmaceutical companies when 
applying for drug approval. Although a 50% or greater re-
duction in the number of seizures came from antiepileptic 
drug trials, this endpoint is commonly used across a broad 
spectrum of interventions, including long-term outcomes 
of epilepsy surgery,7,8 cannabidiol,9 diet,10,11 and exer-
cise.12 A single number, taken from regulatory approval 
purposes, does not necessarily correspond to a significant 
benefit for those with the disease. I am not suggesting that 
a threshold lower than 50% should become standard, but 
rather that using a 50% threshold needs to be thoughtfully 
considered. Even in clinical trials, a lower threshold may 
be supported if the adverse effects of an outcome are not 
serious, if there is a lack of availability of other interven-
tions, or if a cost–benefit assessment supports using a 
lower threshold. In cases where patients have tried treat-
ments that met the 50% threshold and those treatments 
were unsuccessful, clinicians need to be aware of other in-
terventions that may be effective at lower degrees of mag-
nitude that may help their patients.

As a researcher without epilepsy, I would have taken 
this conventional level of clinical significance at face 
value. I would not have questioned why 50% is commonly 
considered a clinically meaningful change. Had I been a 
researcher focusing on epilepsy, I imagine I would have 
included it as an outcome (if relevant) in any studies I 
were to design. As a person with epilepsy who has un-
dergone countless drug switches, dosage increases, and 
other treatments to no effect, a 33% reduction in seizure 
frequency was life changing, whereas a 50% threshold 
of “meaningful” seems idealistic and out of touch with 
my reality. People with DRE deserve better than a 33% 
reduction in seizure frequency; however, when there is 
no choice between an intervention that meets the 50% 
threshold and those that can provide smaller reductions, 
many would consider any reduction better than no reduc-
tion at all. In my case, lower reductions have provided me 
with much-needed and gratefully received reprieves. For 

others with the disease, 50% might not represent enough 
improvement. Although seizure freedom is the goal of ep-
ilepsy treatment, seizure control cannot be obtained for 
approximately 35% of patients in clinic-based cohorts.13 
These individuals are at higher risk of suicide and psychi-
atric comorbidities, mortality, cognitive impairment, and 
decreased quality of life. Full-service epilepsy centres with 
multidisciplinary teams may help people with DRE meet 
the psychological and social challenges many of them 
face. Furthermore, little research has been done on recov-
ery from seizures. New interventions in this area may help 
ameliorate recovery for those with DRE.

There are more than 20 types of epilepsy syndromes, 
which have different causes and electroencephalogram 
patterns, originate in different parts of the brain, and af-
fect people of various ages. Seizures manifest themselves 
in many ways, from staring spells to jerking muscle move-
ments to an abrupt loss of consciousness. People with ep-
ilepsy also have differences in the timing, severity, and 
frequency of their seizures. With such a varied disease, 
it is difficult to apply a common outcome to different 
treatments and patients expressing dissimilar symptoms 
of the disease. Although standardized outcomes are im-
portant for comparative purposes between studies, when 
recommending treatment to a person with epilepsy, what 
constitutes a clinically significant change for that par-
ticular individual must be considered. For many people, 
drug-resistant epilepsy is a truly terrible disease to live 
with, with its repeated cycles of pain, violence, and re-
covery. Every seizure from which I am spared enhances 
the quality of my life. To improve the lives of people with 
epilepsy, it is critical to bridge the gap between what is 
broadly considered a meaningful reduction in seizure fre-
quency and the personal perspective of those living with 
this disease.
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